STATUTORY INSTRUMENTS

2016 No. 313
LEGAL AID AND ADVICE, ENGLAND AND WALES

The Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration) (Amendment)
Regulations 2016

Made - - - - Sth March 2016
Laid before Parliament 10th March 2016
Coming into force - - 31st March 2016

The Lord Chancellor makes these Regulations(a) in exercise of the powers conferred by sections
2(3), 13(4) and (5), 15(1), (6), (7) and (9), 21(2) and 41(1) to (3) of the Legal Aid, Sentencing and
Punishment of Offenders Act 2012(b).

Citation, commencement and interpretation
1.—(1) These Regulations may be cited as the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration)
(Amendment) Regulations 2016 and come into force on 31st March 2016.

(2) In these Regulations, “the Criminal Remuneration Regulations” means the Criminal Legal
Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013(c).

Revocation of amending instruments

2. The following are revoked—

(a) the following provisions of the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration etc.) (Amendment)
Regulations 2015(d)—

(1) regulations 1(2)(b) (commencement) and 2(2) (transitional provision), and

(ii) subject to regulation 3, Part 3 (amendments coming into force on 1st April 2016) and
Schedules 4 to 13;

(b) the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration etc.) (Amendment) (No.2) Regulations 2015(e).

Exceptions to revocation

3. Regulation 2(a)(ii) does not apply to the following provisions of regulation 6 of the Criminal
Legal Aid (Remuneration etc.) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 (amendments to the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations)(f)—

(a) Section 42(1) of the Legal Aid, Sentencing and Punishment of Offenders Act 2012 (c. 10) provides that in Part 1 of that Act
“Regulations” means Regulations made by the Lord Chancellor and “prescribed” means prescribed by regulations (except
in Schedule 6).

(b) 2012 c. 10.

(¢) S.I.2013/435.

(d) S.I. 2015/1369, amended by S.I. 2015/1678 and 2015/2049 (revoked by regulation 2(b) of these Regulations).

(e) S.I.2015/2049.

(f) Amended by S.1. 2015/1678 and 2015/2049 (revoked by regulation 2(b) of these Regulations).



(a) paragraph (4)(b)(iii), (c) and (d) (amendments to regulation 17A: interim payment of
litigators® fees);

(b) paragraphs (5) (amendment to regulation 21: hardship payments) and (6) (amendment to
regulation 28: redetermination of fees by appropriate officer);

(c) paragraph (7)(b)(i) and (ii)) (amendments to paragraph 1(1) of Schedule 2: litigators’
graduated fee scheme — interpretation);

(d) paragraph (8)(f)(i) and (ii) (amendments to paragraph 5 of Schedule 4: rates payable for
the claims specified in regulation 8 — representation in the magistrates’ court).

Amendments to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

4.—(1) The Criminal Remuneration Regulations are amended as follows.

(2) Schedule 2 (litigators’ graduated fee scheme) is amended as set out in Schedule 1 to these
Regulations.

(3) Schedule 3 (proceedings in the Court of Appeal) is amended as set out in Schedule 2 to these
Regulations.

(4) Schedule 4 (rates payable for the claims specified in Regulation 8) is amended as set out in
Schedule 3 to these Regulations.

Application and transitional provision

5. These Regulations do not apply to services made available pursuant to a determination made
before 1st April 2016 under section 13 (advice and assistance for individuals in custody), section
15 (advice and assistance for criminal proceedings) or section 16 (representation for criminal
proceedings) of the Legal Aid, Sentencing and Punishment of Offenders Act 2012.

Shailesh Vara
Parliamentary Under Secretary of State
5th March 2016 Ministry of Justice



SCHEDULE 1 Regulation 4(2)

Amendments to Schedule 2 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

1. For the table following paragraph 6(2) (basic fees for cracked trials of guilty pleas)(a),

substitute the following—

“Class of Offence
Type of A B C D E F G H I J K
case
Cracked 904. 709. 524. 859. 233. 224, 224, 237. 253. 904. 773.

trial 58 15 83 35 03 23 23 00 67 58 86

Guilty 680. 556. 442. 646. 184. 195. 195. 190. 174. 680. 640.
plea 39 11 91 36 70 81 81 97 60 39 &4

2. In paragraph 7 (trial where the number of pages of prosecution evidence is less than or equal

to the PPE Cut-off)(b)—
(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (basic fees for trials), substitute the following—

“Class of Offence

Type of A B C
case
Trial 1,46 1,09 739.
7.58 7.66 59 4.20

D E F G H I J K

1,39 352. 357. 357. 357. 357. 1,46 1,03
72 60 60 75 44 758 1.82

””
k)

and
(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (3) (length of trial proxy), substitute the

following—

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).
(b) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).



EULVO'CT  STYI0TI 1V T8Y01  ¥SLEO'L  €L°SS6'S  €L°SS6'S  16°€HT'L SOI9Y'IT  S9LE6'S  €8'65S°6 STYI0TI 8¢
9r'09S Tl #8865 1T €€191°01  9L°9T89  61'9LL'S  61'9LL'S  €S9T0°L 06'810°TI  09¥S98  08'6TT6 +886STI LC
I8°CLOTE PYECI'IT  $TOP8'6  66'SI99  €9965°C  S9965°C  LI'6089 8L9LSOI  €S1LES  LL6688 HHECIII 9¢
PILSSTT  $0°899°01  SI°61S'6  ITSOV'9  OI'LIY'S  OI'LIF'S 081659 €9v€I'0l  87'880°8  #L'69S'8 +0°899°01 ¢c
8Y'00I°TT T9TOTOI  LO'86I'6  9LT6I'9  LSLET'S  LSLET'S  E€VPLED  6VT69'6  6£008°L CTL6ET'S T9T0TOI 1
TSEIO0l  1TLEL'6  067TLYS  €89L6°C  TO'SSO'S  TO'8SO'S  90°LST9  9€°0ST6  6L0ISL  69606L ITLEL'G €C
9I'LTI'Ol  I81LT'6  TI'VPS'8  06°09L°S  SY'SL8Y  8F'8L8F  O0L6£6'S TTB0SS  6I'1TTL 66'T1LS'L ISILT6 (44
0S'0¥9'6  OV'S6L'S  LESITS 96 VPS'S  $6'869F Y6869t  99°CILSC  LP'8SE8  191€6'9  LTVETL  OF'86L'S | ¥4
P8ESI'6  68VTE8  €9988°L  €I'6CES  8P6IST  8P6IST  €9716V°S  99°806°L  II'THY9  £5968°9  68VCE'S 0¢C
LT°L998  ST098L  LS98Y'L  69990°C TI'00EY  TI'00EY  ¥S0TT'S VvTLOY'L  LL'68T9  88°0€S9  ST098°L 61
TSO8I'8  09°S6E°L  TS980'L  9T¥O8Y  9L'080°F  9L080F  SH6v6y  €8°STOL  SYLE6'S  PYTSII'9  09°S6E°L 81
98°€69°L  96'0€6'9  L¥'989°9  TSIPSY  IYI98°C  IYI98°C  SE€'8LOY  THPS8S9  TI'S8S’S  09°66LSC  960£69 LT
0TLOTL  TE99Y'9  TP98T9  6£6LTY  SOTYIC  SOTYOE  9TLOVY  00°EVI'9  6LTET'S 96°¢Er'S  TE99¥9 91
ITLOL9 891000  LE9S8S  S69I0Y  69TIPE  69TTPE  SI9Ely  6ST0L°C  9¥'088F  1€890°C  89°100°9 Sl
€V'90T°9  €0°LES'S  TEI8K'S  ISPSL'E  PEEOTE  PEEOTE  LOSI9SE  61°09TS  €1'8TSY  L9TOLY  €O'LESS 14!
€9°C0L'S  6£TLOC  8T980°C  LOT6V'E 86'€86'C 86'€86C SI'C6SE  LL'SISY 08 SLIY  TOLEEY  6€TLOS ¢l
08v0TS  PLLO9Y  TT989Y  +v9°6CC’E  LVOILT  LVOILT  6STIEC  SCLLEY  LYET8'E  8CIL6C YL LO9Y 1!
66'€OLY  OI'EVI'y  CTO6LTY  8E€T96TC 909€ST  909€ST  99'1€0°C  PO6'SE6'E  €6TIPE  PLSO9E  Ol'Evly I
8V €0CY  6TSLY9C  LITLYE  6LTO9T  PITIET  POTIET 180SLT  TSI6¥'E  9STOI'E  S96£T°E  6T°SLIE 01
6V vTL'C  TOOIT'E  €VELY'e  SCIEY'T  SYE60T  SYE60T  6TT8PT  8€0S0°C  ILISLT  YOVLST  T60ITE 6
8V’ SPT'E  9S9PLT  OLVLO'E  L6'691°T  STSLS'T  STSL8'T  6LEITT  +¥T609T  L80OOVT  #¥'80ST  9S9VLT 8
9TECIL'T L8ESTT S9LEYT IS6L8T  €8TEYT  €8TE9T  SPSI6l  SI'IPIT €O TI0T  TCTOIT  L8ESTT L
VOISIT  LITT9L'T  6S00T°CT  SO'68S'T  €98ET  €098€ T  TILI9T  TI'EL9'T  OTITY'T  86'S69°T  LITTIL'I 9
I8'8L9°T  O9I'I9T'T  $S9SLT  $9°00€T  066£I°T  066£I°T  98vec’T  OI'86I°T  19°€€TT  80°S8T'T  9I'19T°1 S
€901l 6L69L  €6°0TE T €8°600°1 LL'868 LL'868  S9€E0’T 0€'IEL eeErs S9°6L8 6L°69L %
elvLS vSTST 67798 69°¢0L Y6'vv9 Y6'vv9 8S9IL ¢6'6¢£C B934 88°CSY ¥§'TST €
000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 [4

000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 000 I

Y &xoud [ &xoud I &xoad [ &xoud o Lxoud g &xoud g Axoad (g L&xoad ) Lxoud g &xoud vy Axoud sdoq u1
y13ua) y13uaj y13uaj y13uaj y13ua) y13ua) y13ua) y13uaj y13uaj y13uaj y13ua) y3uay
Ly Uy Uy Uy Ly Ly Ly Uy Uy Uy Ly mu,,




0L'T08°LT
T6'0€€°LT
1€°658°9C
$8°L8E°9T
¥$916°SC
A8 Y
IV YL6' YT
85°€0S YT
16C€0'YC
6€T95°€T
¥0'760°€C
¥8179°TC
08'1S1°CC
16'189°1C
81'CITIT
19°CYL0T
0T €LT0T
€6'¢08°61
€8veC61
6859881
0r'00t'81
ELEI6LT
LO'LTY LT
17°0v6'91
SLESY 9T
60°L96°S1
A
9L°€66'71
I1°LOS Y1
vr020v1
8LEESET

6£°020°9¢C
TV LLS'ST
9SEI'ST
08°1694C
91°6VCHC
79908°¢T
6119€°€T
98°1T6°CC
S9'6LY'TT
€S°L£0°CT
¥$S65°1C
S9¢SIIT
S8'IIL0T
81°0LC°0C
19°828°61
SILsE6!l
6L SY6'S1
rS Y05 81
0'€90°81
8€TTYLI
YL ESILI
€C8IL9I
€6'7STII1
TSL8LST
11°CTeSI
0L9S8 V1
0€16E 1
88°CT6CI
8 097°C1
LOS66CI
L9°6TSTI

9690161
1L9€1°61
76799881
6£96S 81
1€°92¢°81
6295081
€EO98LLT
EY9ISLI
6S YT LI
6L9L691
S0'LOL9T
8E°LEYII
9L°L9T1°91
61°868°S1
69'879°C1
€T6SESI
78°680°C1
160281
TSI
0028CTY1
9E V10 V1
8T €69°¢CI
61°TLECT
01" 1S0°€1
T00ELTI
€6'807CI
¥8°L80°CI
9L99L°11
LYSPPIT
6SVCITI
16°€08°01

LY €0TT1
P8OIITI
YT810°11
996601
01°€€8°01
95" 0L 0l
70'879°01
7S 6650l
90°€9¥°01
19°0LE°01
91°8LT°01
SL'S81°01
cee60°01
L6°000°01
€9'806°6
8C918°6
L6ETL'6
89°1€9°6
0'6€5°6
9I°LYY'6
T0°95€°6
STSPI'6
86’8
0L°€TL'S
€6'CTISS
91°20¢'8
6£°160°8
19°088°L
$8'699°L
LO6SY'L
0€'8YT'L

S6'TIS01
€I 18¢°01
T€08T0l
TS611°01
TL'886°6
¥6'LS8°6
91°LTL'6
0t'965°6
€9°59%°6
88'V€E6
T1Iv0T'6
6£°€L0°6
99°Ct6'8
v6 118°8
TT189°8
TS°0SS°8
786118
T1'68C°8
vr'8S1°8
9L°LT0'8
SELO6S'L
€6'0TL'L
ISPPSL
01°89¢°L
89°161°L
9T’ SI0°L
¥8°8¢8°9
€7799°9
109849
65°60€9
8I°€€19

S6TIS01
€I 18¢°01
T€0ST0l
TS611°01
TL'886°6
¥6'LS8°6
91°LTL'6
0t'965°6
€9°59t°6
88'V€EE6
TIv0T'6
6£°€L0°6
99°C¥6'8
v6'118°8
TT189°8
TS°05S°8
786118
T1'68C°8
vr'8S1°8
9L°LT0'8
SELO6S'L
€6'0TL'L
ISPPSL
01°89¢°L
89°161°L
9T’ SI0°L
¥8°8¢8°9
€7799°9
109849
65°60€9
8I°€€19

61" 8TV 11
6€8EE° 1
6T 8YC 11
0T'8SI'II
¥1°890°1 1
€1'8L601
S1'888°01
1T°86L°01
TE80L0T
SP'819°01
¥9°87S 01
LY'8EY01
€rereol
€V'65T01
LL69T°01
91°080°01
8570666
70" 106°6
vS1186
60TTL'6
Y6'v€9°6
8S'LIY'6
TT00T6
¥8°786°8
87°'S9L'8
11°875°8
YL 0EC'S
8CEIT'S
10°968°L
€9°8LY°L
LT19Y'L

8E6ILYT
SS'86T YT
€8°LLYET
TTLSY'ET
699¢€0°¢€C
6T919°TC
66'S61°TC
LLSLL1T
L9°SSETT
99°6€6°0C
9L°G15°0C
L6S60°0C
9T9L9°61
8995761
8I°LES'ST
6L L1181
16°866°L1
TE6LSLT
YTO91°LI
9T IYL91
SSYTE9IL
TrT88SlI
8T OVYSI
71°866 11
10°9SS*v1
LYETT I
ELTLYEL
6S°62C ¢l
9" L8LCI
1€°SreTI
81°€06°T1

00°STEY1
YO 11TY1
11,601
0T€86°¢l
1€698°¢€1
vy SSLEl
09 1v9°¢1
8L°LTS €1
86 €IV El
61°00€°¢T
vy o8I°cl
69°TLOCT
86'856CI
8T SY8CI
19°1€LTI
96'L19°CI
€er0STI
€L°06£CI
€ILLTTI
LS €91TI
STIS0TI
0T'89L11
PSP 11
60TOCT1
€0'616°01
L6°SE€9°01
767SE°01
L8690°01

18°98L°6

SL'E0S6

0L°0TC°6

6L°68C°61
18°€86°81
T6'LL9ST
CITLEST
Tr'990°81
T809LLI
0€SSHLI
88°6VI°LI
9S 891
€E'6£591
6191
Y1°6T6°S1
81'¥T9°C1
ALY
95 ¥10°C1
68°60L V1
KXY ad|
78°001v1
€r'96L°€Cl
ereerel
eroelr el
11°098°CI
60°0€SCI
€0°00TCl
€0'0LS8TT
00°0vS°11
L6'60CT1
S6'6L8°01
16'6¥S°01
88°61C°01

98°688°6

6€020°9¢C
TV LLS'ST
9SvEI'ST
08'169'%C
91°6¥C YT
79908°€T
61179€°€T
98°1T76°CC
S9'6LYTT
€5°LE0TT
¥$ 665 1T
S9€SIIT
S8T1L0T
81°0LT°0C
19'878°61
SI'LsE6!1
6L SY6'81
vSY0S 81
0r'€90°81
8CTTY'LI
YL ESTLT
€C'8IL91
€6CST91
TSL8LST
11°CCE ST
0L9S8 V1
0€16€Y1
88°6T6EL
8¥°09%°€C1
LOS66TT
LY6TSTI

6S
8¢
LS
9¢
¢S
125
€S
[43
IS
0s
6v
1%
Ly
9v
9%
144
1914
(44
I
0¥
6¢
8¢
LE
9¢
ce
v
123
[43
I€
0¢
6¢



€L°S0S Ty
LO6TOTY
8STSS 1Y
YT9LO'TY
90°009°0%
YO vT1 0
81'819°6€
LY'TLI'6E
76'969°8€
TS1TT8E
6T9YLLE
TTILT'LE
0£96L°9¢
€S 1TE9¢
T6'978°S€
8Y'TLE'SE
61°8687€
SOYCr've
80°0S6°€€E
9TILY EE
09°200°¢€
80°6CSCE
vL'6S0°TE
CCT8SIE
TS601°1€
$9'9€9°0¢
€6'€91°0€
LET169°6T
96'81C°6C
TL9YL'8T
€9YLT'8T

06'S08°6¢
65°65€°6E
6 €168
6T L9Y'8E
0€°120°8¢
TYSLS'LE
S9'6CI°LE
66'€89°9¢
€Y'8€T9¢
66 TOL'SE
SO'LYESE
Y206 e
6T LSY'¥E
8TTIOYE
9¢€°L9G°¢¢
9¢'TTIEe
LY LLYTE
8T E€LTTE
18°88L°1¢
rrvrele
L1°006°0€
2095¥°0¢
L6'TTI0°0E
€0'895°6C
0THTI'6C
81°089°8¢C
98°9¢7°8C
CEE6LLT
Y6'6Y¢ LT
99'906°9C
LY €9%°9C

8LTIS LT
LLOVS'LT
T8'89C°LT
£6'966'9C
60°STL9T
0€°€SY9T
8C°181°9C
76'606°ST
0€'8€9°CC
SL'99€°ST
9T°$60°ST
T8'€T8YT
€Y' TSS YT
01°18C¥C
78600 1C
€9'8€L°ET
LY L9Y'ET
LEI6IET
€€'ST6'CC
SEYE9°TT
T e8eTT
¢STIIee
€L IP8'IT
L6'0LS 1T
8T°00€°1¢C
€9'620°1C
¥0'6SL°0C
T6°88¥°0C
¥0'81C°0C
T9°LY6°61
9T'LL961

1678011
99°'166°¢1
Tr'868°¢Cl
1T°608°¢1
10CILEl
€8'819°¢I
89°CTS¢Cl
SSTEYEl
er6eeel
YEIrTEl
LTESTCL
127°090°¢1
LT'L96°CT
91'¥L8TI
8I'I8LTI
17°889°CI
9T°S65°TI
TET0STI
T 60r Tl
€S91€TI
99°€TTTI
18°0€1°CI
86'LE0CI
LUSY6'TT
6£TSSTI
T96SL11
6899911
91 ¥LS 11
9 I8P 11
LLSSETT
01°96C°11

LUTLS T
01 0vr' vl
90°60¢ V1
10'SLIVI
L69Y0 V1
v6'S16°C1
€6V8LET
06°€59°€1
06CCS¢Cl
06'16€°€1
76'09T°¢1
v6'6T1°€El
$6'866C1
66'L98°CI
€0°LELTT
60'909°CI
YISLY'TI
1TYreTt
8TEITTI
9¢€780°CI
SYIS6° 11
vS 0TS 11
§9°689°11
9L°8SST1
88°LTY' 11
10°L6T°11
Y1991 11
8T G011
vy v06°01
09°€LLOT
LLTY9'01

LUTLS T
01 ovy' vl
90°60¢ V1
10'SLI VI
L69Y0 V1
v6'S16°C1
€6V8LET
06°€59°€1
06'CCS¢Cl
06'16€°€1
76'09T°¢1
v6'6T1°€El
$6'866C1
66'L98°TI
€0°LELTT
60'909°CI
YISLYCI
1TYreTt
8TEITTI
9¢€T80°CI
SYIS6° 11
vS 0TS 11
$9°689°11
9L°8SST1
88°LTY' 11
10°L6T°11
P1991°T1
8T G011
vy v06°01
09°€LL0T
LLTY9'01

19°12TY1
ISTETYI
I 1701
I€1S6°¢T
1T198°¢€1
TTTLLET
10°189°¢I
06°065°€1
08°00S°¢I
0L 01Y' €1
09°0Z€¢l
0S0€T°€1
o' or1el
0€0S0°€1
0T°096CI
01°0L8°C1
00°08LCI
06'689°C1
08'66SCI
0L'60S°C1
09617l
0S°62€CI
0v'6€TCI
0g6v1°TI
0T'650°CI
0169611
00'6L8°11
06'88LTI
08'869°11
0L'809°T1
6S°8ISTI

09°G18°LE
19°16€°LE
TLL96°9€
€6'¢PS9¢
YT 0TI'9¢
€9'969°S¢
LI'ELT'SE
08618 1¢
TS9Trve
SE€00vE
97°085°¢¢
0€°LSTEE
eV rELTE
99 11¢T¢
00688°1¢
V99 1€
86 €0 T€
€9'129°0¢
LE661°0E
TTLLL'6T
91°6S€°6C
17°€€6°8C
LETISST
£9'680°8C
66'L99°LT
SYovTLe
T0°$T8°9C
69°€0¥°9C
SY'786°ST
TE195°6T
6T 0¥1°ST

STR98°LI
€9°ESLLT
€0°6£9°LI
SYYTsLl
06'60%°LI
CESOTLI
€8°081°LI
SE990°L1
8815691
Y LE]II
00°€TL9I
0980991
1TY61°91
S8'6LE9I
0569791
61 1S1°91
689¢0°91
19°CT6°S1
CE'808°ST
TIv69°S1
16'6LS°S1
TLS9YSI
CSTISEST
0’ LETST
8TETISI
LT°600°ST
60°S68 71
O I8L Y1
6699971
L6TSS VI
L6 8EY VI

09°178°8¢
1LT1S°8T
€6'¢0T'8T
€TS68°LT
¥998S°LT
€I'8LT LT
TL696°9C
0t 199°9¢C
LI'€SE°9T
¥0°S¥0°9C
00°LEL'ST
90°6T¥°ST
1T1TI°6T
SYEI8Ye
8L°S0S VT
17°861°4C
vL068°€T
CEE8S €T
909LT°¢T
98'896°CC
9L 199°TC
YLYSETT
€8'L¥0°CT
10'1YL1T
8TYEY'IT
€9°LTIIT
01°1Z8°0¢
Y9 ¥15°0C
0€80C°0¢
€0°206°61
9866561

06°S08°6¢
65°65€°6€
6€°€16°8¢
6T L9t'8E
0€°120°8¢
TV SLS'LE
S9°6TI°LE
66'€89°9¢
€Y'8€T9€E
66TOL'SE
SO'LYEGE
V206 e
6T LSY'vE
8TTIOYE
9€°L96°¢€
9¢'TTIEE
LY LLYTE
8T EETTE
I8'88L°TE
rrvrele
LT°006°0€
209S¥°0¢
L6'T10°0€
€0'895°6¢C
0TYC1'6C
8%°089'8¢C
98°9€7°8¢
SEEO6L'LT
v6'6Y¢ LT
99'906'9¢
LY €9¥°9C

06
68
88
L8
98
¢8
78
€8
[4
18
08
6L
8L
LL
9L
SL
YL
€L
L
IL
0L
69
89
L9
99
<9
¥9
€9
9
19
09



0€°6€¢°LS
§T°098°9¢
61°18¢°9¢
T1°206°SS
LO€TY'SS
10'976'vS
S6YIY' 1S
68°686°¢S
¥8°905°¢S
LL'LTOES
IL'8%S°CS
99°690°CS
09°06S°TS
PSIIIIS
81°7€9°0S
€' EST0S
9EvLI'6Y
sesol6v
0S91L'8Y
08°LET Y
9T 6SL'LY
88°08C'LY
99°208°9%
09¥TE 9y
89°9t8°Ct
€6'89€°SY
€C 168 v
06 €Iy v
79°9¢6°¢Y
6 6SY Y
€ST86'CY

16'769°€S
LT SYT' €S
€L°S6LTS
6T9YETS
L6'968°TS
SLLYY'1S
¥9'866°0S
€9'67S°0S
¥L'001°0S
S6'1S9°6Y
8T €0T'6v
0L ¥SL'8Y
¥T90¢ 8P
68°LSS LY
¥9°60v°LY
0S°196°9%
9 €IS 9P
¥$°690°9%
€LLI9'SY
10°0LT°SY
¥ CTL VY
16 VLT Y
€SLT8'EY
SToscey
80°€E6TY
2098Y° Ty
90°6€0°TY
1TT68° 11
LY SYI 1Y
£8'869°0%
TETSTOY

€TELT9E
9t"'666°'SE
YL STL'SE
60CSH SE
61" 8LI'SE
¥6'706'7€
9 1€9'V€
€0'8SEPE
99'¥80°7€
rET18°€E
80'8€G €€
8819C°¢E
YL 166TE
S9'8ILTE
9 SrrTe
Y9 TLITE
TL668°1¢
98979°1¢
90 ¥Se1€E
1€180°1¢
£9'808°0¢
86'S£S°0€
T e9T0¢
68°066°6C
€Y'8IL'6T
€09 6T
LY€LT'6T
8¢°106°8C
S1'629'8C
L6'9S€°8T
¥8'¥80°8¢C

Y1°6L691
LLS88°91
0v'T6L91
€0'669°91
99°609°91
6CTIS91
6'81791
CSSTE91
81°CET 91
18°8€1°91
v Sv0'91
LOTS6'ST
0L"8S8CI
€EC9LST
96°'1L9°C1
6S'8LS ST
TS8P SI
S8I6€°SI
81'86C°S1
11°60T°S1
YLITICI
LEBIOST
00°ST6'v1
€9 1E8 VI
STYELYI
6879 V1
SISl
SI'SSHpl
1879¢v1
6V 1LT Y1
0T8LIVI

S6'LE9'81
$9905°81
SEGLEST
90T 81
8LTII'SI
IS 186°LI
YT 0S8'LI
66'8ILLI
€LLYS LY
61" 9SYLI
9T STELT
€0v61°LI
T8T90°L1
09°1€691
0t'008°91
17769991
20'8€591
7890791
LYSLT91
1Svr1°91
9€°€1091
1T°C88°S1
LOTSL'GT
¥6'619°C1
18'88%°CI
69°LSESI
65°9TCSI
61°S60°ST
0r'v96°t1
Teees Yl
YTTOL Y1

S6'LE9°'81
$9905°81
SECLEST
90T 81
8LTII'SI
IS 186°LI
YT 0S8'LI
66'8ILLI
€LLYS LY
61" 9SY LI
9T STELT
€0v61°LI
T8T90°L1
09°1€691
0t'008°91
17769991
20'8€591
7890791
LY SLT91
1Svr1°91
9€°€1091
1T7C88°S1
LOTSL'GT
¥6'619°C1
18'88%°CI
69°LSESI
65°9TCSI
61°S60°ST
0r'v96't1
Teees Yl
YTTOL Y1

ELYIOLT
€9'YC691
€SPE]9I1
€V vrL91
€€YS9°91
€TY9591
EIvLY 91
€0'¥8€91
€6'€6C91
€8°¢0C91
ELETTIT
€9°¢20°91
€5°€E6'CT
€V EP8SI
TEESLST
TTE€99°C1
TIELS ST
20 €8Y°SI
T6'T6€°ST
T8T0ESI
TLTITST
T9°TTISI
40!
rTre vl
TETS8 Y1
TTILYI
11°CL9Y1
10°C8S V1
16’1611
18107 V1
ILTIEYT

LTOIO'TS
00°€85°0S
¥6'SS1°0S
86'8CTL 6V
T1zog6y
9€°6L8'8Y
0L'8¥1'8Y
91°CT0°8Y
TLS6S LY
9€°691°LY
(AN 7R
L69TE9Y
€6'068°SY
00°S9¥°SP
SI'6€0°Sy
eI
6L LST VY
LTT9LEY
r89ecey
IS116CY
698y Ty
LT T90°CY
SI'9¢9°' Iy
YTIIC T
€r'98L0Y
TL19E°0Y
01°LE6°6E
09°CIS°6¢
0T'880°6¢
06'€99°8¢
0L°6€T°8¢

€L'8TYIT
8 EICIT
16'861°1C
66'€80°1C
80°696°0C
LT¥S8°0C
ST6EL0T
YEYT9°0C
€¥'605°0C
1$76€°0T
09°6LT°0¢
69191°0C
8L°6¥0°0C
L8YE6'61
S6'618°61
¥0°S0L°61
106561
1TSLY61
0€09¢°61
6£°SYT61
1S°0€1°61
S9°S10'61
7800681
0098L°81
1T 1L9°81
795G 81
891481
C6'97€ 81
YT TIT 81
9¢°L60°81
68°T86'LI

S6TEY'8E
1S°TC1'8¢
LOTISLE
Y9 10S°LE
0T 161°LE
LL088°9€
€€°0LS9€
68°6SCT°9¢
SY'616°S€E
20°6€9°S¢
65°8TE°SE
SI'810°SE
1L LOLYE
LT L6EYE
¥8°980°t¢
OV 9LL'EE
€099 '€
YL SSIEE
CSSP8TE
SYeesTe
91" STTTE
SSCI6'IE
€L°S09°TE
1096T°1¢
8€7986°0¢
¥8°9L9°0¢
0t'L9€°0¢
S0'850°0€
08'8¥7L°6C
€9'6£°6C
LS0ET°6C

16'769°€S
LTSYTES
€L°C6L°TS
6T9Y€CS
L6'968°1S
SLLYY'IS
79'866°0S
€9°675°0S
¥L°001°0S
S6'1S9°6Y
8T €0T 61
0L ¥SL'SY
¥T90€°8Y
68°LS8LY
¥9'60t" LY
0S° 1969
9" €15 9Y
¥S$S90°9%
ELLIOSY
10°0L1°SY
I CCLYY
16 VLT VY
€C°LT]EY
ST08EeY
80°€E6TY
20'98% Y
90°6£0°CY
1768 1Y
LY SYI 1Y
€8'869°01
TETSTOY

ICl
0cI1
611
811
LTT
911
CIT
144!
ell
[41!
IT1
Ort1
601
801
LOT
901
col
YOIl
€0l
01
101
00T

66

86

L6

96

S6

¥6

€6

6

16



86°L86° 1L
IT9ISTL
STYRO'IL
LETLSOL
61°001°0L
7987969
SL9ST 69
88'789°89
00°€1T'89
EUTYLLY
9T'69T°L9
8€°L6L99
T$°6TE99
79°€68°S9
LLT8E°S9
0660619
208 ¥9
S1'996°€9
8TY6Y'€9
1¥°220°€9
€5°05529
$9'8L0°C9
6L°909°19
T6'YELT9
£0°€99°09
LT'T61°09
6T 61L6S
Y LYT'6S
CCCLL'SS
Tr'L6T'8S
9¢€°8I8°LS

6L°LTY'L9
6L786°99
08°1¥5°99
18'860°99
18°659°69
18°CIT'S9
T8'69L%9
789719
78°€88°¢C9
€8°07'€9
78'L66'79
€8'76S°C9
v8I11°C9
¥8'899°19
¢8'6TT’19
C8'C8L°09
98'6£€°09
98°968°6S
98°¢St'6S
L8010°6S
L8 L9S8S
L8YTI]S
88°189°LS
88'8CTLS
68°S6L9S
06TSE9S
68°606°SS
0699%°SS
16°€20°SS
06085 vS
16'LETYS

Y 1¥9' vy
6V 1LE VY
vSI101 v
19°T€8°¢Y
99°195°¢Y
LeTey
8L 1T0EY
Y8 ISLTY
68181 Tt
96 11Ty
10°CY6 T
LOTLY 1Y
ereor' iy
61 TEL Y
vT798°0Y
0€T65°0Y
9gTTE oY
Tr'Tsoor
LY'T8L'6E
€STIS 6
8CTVT 6
S9TL6'SE
0LTOL'8E
9L°TEY'8E
78T91°8¢
88°T68°LE
€6'TC9°LE
00°€S¢E°LE
S0'¢80°LE
11°€18°9¢
LT €YS9€E

SILes'6l
81'SYL 61
17°€59°61
YT 195°61
LT 69761
0€'LLE 61
TEe8T61
9¢°€61°61
6€°101°61
€7'600°61
9Y' L1681
81'ST8'8I
TSEEL'8T
vS 1981
LS 6YS 81
09°LSP81
€9°69¢°81
99°€LT 81
0L T81°81
€L°680°81
9L°L66°LI
6L°S06°L1
T8 EISLI
C8ITLLY
88°679°L1
16'LES'LT
€6'SPY LI
T9TSELI
ST6STLI
88'COI°LI
1SCTLOLT

08°069°TC
90°095°CC
€C'6CY' T
6586T°CC
S8'L91°CC
I1°L£0°CT
8€906°1C
Y9'SLLTT
06'779°1¢C
LTYISTIT
€Y' €8ETIT
69°TSTIC
S6'1TI°1T
TT166°0C
81°098°0C
YL 6TL0C
10°665°0C
LT89Y°0C
€5°LECTOT
6L90C°0¢C
90'9L0°0C
TESY6'61
8S118°61
$8'¢89'61
11¢ss6l
LETTY'61
€9'16C°61
06'091°61
91°0€0°61
€v'668°81
6989L°81

08°069°TC
90°095°CC
€C'6CY T
65°86T°CC
S8'L91°CC
I1°L£0°TT
8€906°1C
Y9'SLLTT
06'7¥9°1¢C
LTYISTC
€V €8E 1T
69°CSTIC
S6'1TI°1T
TT166°0C
81°098°0C
YL 6TL0C
10°66S°0C
LT89Y°0C
€5°LECTOT
6L90C°0C
90'9L0°0C
TESY6'61
8Sv18°61
$8'¢89'61
11°¢ss61
LETTY'61
€9'16C°61
06'091°61
91°0€0°61
€v'668°81
6989L°81

S8°L0861
SLLIL6Y
S9°LT9'61
goLeS 61
S LYY61
SeLSE 61
STLIT'61
SI'LLT'61
S0°L80°61
696681
7890681
YL 91881
¥9'9CL'81
7$9€9°81
Y ors 8l
Y€9S1'81
¥T'99¢€°81
Y1°9LT'81
70'981°81
76'$60°81
¥8°S00°81
YLSI6'LI
€9°GT8’LT
€C°CELLT
€V SY9°LT
€CCSS LT
€TSILL
EIGLE LT
€0°S8TLI
€6VOI°LT
€8 VOI°LI

17°950°t9
96°6€9°¢9
ILY1T€9
98°€6L°C9
€0°€LETY
L1°TS6°19
€e1es 19
LY'OIT'T9
¥9'689°09
6L89C°09
v6'LY8'6S
60°LTY 6S
$T°900°6S
0t'$8S°8S
9S¥91°8¢
OL'EYL'LS
98CTE LS
10°206°9S
LT 18198
T€090°9¢
81'6€9°6S
€9'81T°SS
6L L6LYS
Y6'9LE VS
01°956°¢S
YAYISSY
I P11°€S
CS€69°CS
1L'TLTTS
LISSIS
O IEYIS

601761
06'LT8YC
ILYILYT
TS 1099
€E'88Y YT
SI'SLEYT
S6'19C1C
LL8Y1¥T
8S°6E0YT
8€°TTOET
0T'608°¢T
10'969°€T
7878S°¢T
€9'69%°€T
1A E X
STErTee
LOOET €T
L8910°¢T
89€06°CC
61 06LCC
0€'LL9TT
TI'v98Te
T6'0SYTC
YL LEETT
SSyTTee
9¢"111°TC
L1'866°1C
86'1788°1C
6L TLLIT
CS'869°IT
Y9 EvS 1T

Yy TTo’LY
L9919°LY
68°01€°LY
01°600°LY
T€669°9
CSE6E 9
LLL809Y
66 18L'SY
1TILY Sy
€YOLI'SY
SO98 v
98'8SS Y
60°€ST Y
0€°LY6 Y
€S 19 ey
SLseeey
L6'620°CY
61 VLY
ov'81t'CY
€9CIICY
$8'908° 1+
LOTOS Y
6T S61° 1Y
1568801
€L €8S 0
S6'LLT OV
91°CL6'6E
6£999°6€
19°09¢°6¢
78°€50°6¢
8ETEVL']E

6L°LTY'L9
6L786°99
0811599
18'860°99
18°659°69
18°CIT'S9
T8'69LY9
T8'9TEY9
78°€88°€9
€8°077°€9
78,6679
€8'7SS°C9
¥8TI1°C9
78'899°19
¢8'¢TT19
G8'T8L09
98°'6£€°09
98°968°6S
98°€St'6S
L8'010°6S
LY L9S°8S
L8YTI'8S
88°189°LS
88'8€TLS
68°S6L°9S
06TSE9S
68°606°SS
06'99%°SS
16°€20°SS
06085 vS
16°LETYS

4!
IS1
0S1
671
871
Lyl
4!
Svl
144!
evl
i
4!
4!
6¢l
8¢€1
LET
9¢l
cel
vel
eel
cel
Iel
0¢cl
6¢Cl
8¢CI
LTl
9¢l1
4!
14!
eCl
[44!



70'919°98
LT1°98
0€TLYS8
Tr'00T'S8
SS8TLYS
89°9ST¥8
08'¥8L'E8
Y6'T1€°€8
90°1+8°C8
61°69€C8
TELO6STS
Yy STy 18
LS €S6°08
69°187°08
€8°600°08
C6'LES 6L
L0'990°6L
1TY6S8L
€CTTIL
97"0S9°LL
6S8LI'LL
IL'90L9L
v8vETIL
L6TILSL
01'T16T°SL
TTOIS YL
vELYE YL
81" SLYEL
19°€0 €L
ELTE6TL
98°6SYCTL

L9091°18
LYLTLOS
89'VLT°08
89 1€8°6L
89'88€°6L
69°S6°8L
69C0S°8L
69°65S0°8L
0L919°LL
OL'ELT'LL
0L'0EL9L
1L°L8T9L
TLYY8'SL
TLTOY'SL
TL'8S6'VL
€LSISYL
ELTLOYL
€L6T9°€EL
vL981°EL
YLEYLTL
vL00€TL
SLLSSTL
OLYIVIL
9L TL6°0L
LL'8TSOL
LLS80°0L
LLTY969
8L°661°69
8L°9SL°89
8L EIE]9
8L°0L8L9

€9'600°€S
0L'6ELTS
SL'69YCS
18°661°CS
LY'6T6TS
€6'6S9°1¢
86'68€°1S
SO'0TI'IS
01°058°0S
91°085°0S
TT01€°08
8T°0¥0°0S
€C0LL 6V
6£°00S 61
rr €T 6v
05°096°8¥
95°069°8Y
9°0Tr 8P
L90ST'8Y
vL088"LY
6L°019°LY
S80OvE'LY
16°0L0°LY
L6008°9%
20 1ES9Y
60 19C°9%
Y1°166°SY
0T 1TL'SY
9T 1Y S
TEI8ISY
LETI6TY

17°889°CC
¥T'965°CC
9T0STC
0€CIY'TC
T€0TETT
CE'8TTTT
6€9€1°CC
1¥"¥¥0°CT
YrCS6'1eT
81°098°1¢C
1S°89L°1C
¥S9L9°1C
LS¥8S°1T
09°C6¥°1¢C
€9°00%°1¢C
99'80¢°1¢C
6991T°1C
TLYTIIC
SLTEO1T
8L°0¥6°0C
78'818°0C
$8'96L°0T
L8199°0C
16°TLS 0T
€6'08%°0C
96'88¢°0C
00°L62°0C
20°50T°0¢
SOEIIoc
60°120°0C
162661

S9'E€YL9T
16C19°9¢
L1°T8Y°9C
Y 1SE9C
0L°0TT9C
96'680°9C
€T°656°ST
61'8T8°ST
SLL69°ST
T0°L9S°ST
8T9¢Y ST
¥$60¢°ST
I8'VLI'ST
90't+0°SC
€CEI6YT
6ST8LYT
S8 1S94T
TI1Tsve
8€°06£ 1T
¥9°6STYC
16'8C1¥C
L1'866°€T
€V'L9]°ET
0L9€EL'ET
96'S09°€T
TTSLY €T
6 vrE T
YL EITET
10°€80°€T
LTTS6TT
¥S1T8°TC

S9'EYL9T
16C19°9¢
L1°T8Y°9C
Y 1SE9C
0L°0TT9C
96'680°9C
€T°656°ST
61'8T8°ST
SLL69°ST
T0°L9S°ST
8T9€Y'ST
¥$60¢°ST
I8VLI'ST
90't+0°ST
€CEI6YT
6ST8LYT
S8 1S94T
TI1Tsve
8€°06£ 1T
¥9°6STYC
16'8C1¥C
L1'866°€T
€Y' L9]°ET
0L9€EL'ET
96'509°€T
TTSLY €T
6 vrE T
YL E1T'ET
10°€80°€T
LTTS6TT
¥S1T8°TTC

89'66S°CC
L801STT
LLOTYTT
L9°0€€TT
LSOVCTT
LY 0S1°CT
9€°090°CC
9T0L6°1C
91°088°IC
90°06L°1¢C
96'669°1C
98°609°1¢C
9L615°1C
99°6TY°1¢C
95°6€€°1C
9 61T 1C
9€6S1°1C
9T°690°1¢C
91°6L6°0C
90'688°0¢C
96'86L°0C
98'80L°0C
9L819°0C
99'8TS°0C
9¢"8€1°0C
9t"81¢ 0T
9€'8SC°0C
97'891°0C
91°8L0°0C
S0'886°61
S6'L68°61

¥9°C01°LL
8L189°9L
¥6'09C°9L
60°0¥8°SL
STOIY'SL
0t'866'7L
9SLLS YL
1L9ST'YL
LY SELEL
T0SIEEL
81¥68°CL
CCELYTL
61CS0TL
€9I€9'IL
6L 01T 1L
S6'68L°0L
01°69€°0L
ST'8Y6°69
0t"'LTS 69
9$901°69
TL'S89'89
98'+¥97°89
TOvr8°LY
L1 €TY'L9
€€°700°L9
81185799
€9°091°99
6L6£L°S9
¥6'81€°S9
01°868%9
STLLY'Y9

S6'67'8T
LL9EE"8T
8C°€TT]T
8€°011°8C
0T'L66°LT
00'¥88°LT
T8OLL'LT
€9'LS9°LT
vy vySLT
STIEY' LT
90'81€°LT
L8Y0OT'LT
89°'160°LT
61'8L6°9C
0£°698°9¢
TI'TsL9T
76'8€9°9¢
YL STS9T
SSTIY9T
9€°66C°9C
L17981°9C
86TLO9C
6L°65S6°ST
19°9%8°6T
17 €€LST
TT0T9°ST
€0'L0S"ST
¥8€6£°ST
99°08C°ST
9" L91°CT
8T1S0°ST

9 10¥°LS
¥8°660°LS
LO'06L9S
8T 89S
0S°8LI°9S
TLTLY'SS
¥6'995°SS
91°19T°SS
8€°6S6YS
09°6Y9vS
€8 EVEYS
¥0'8€0 VS
9TTEL'ES
8 9TH ¢S
0L0T1°¢S
€6'v18°CS
¥1°60S°CS
LE€0TTS
65°L68 1S
08°16S°1S
2098T°IS
¥T086°0S
9" ¥L9°0S
69°89€°0S
16°790°0S
€rLSL6Y
rE1ST 6
95 SrI‘6Y
6L°6£8'8Y
00'7€S 8P
€T8TT'8Y

L9091°18
LYLTLOS
89'YLT°08
89°1€8°6L
89'88€°6L
69°St6'SL
69°C0S'8L
69°65S0°8L
0L919°LL
OL'ELT'LL
0L'0EL9L
IL'L8TIL
TLYY8'SL
TLT0V'SL
TL'8S6'VL
€LCIS YL
ELTLOYL
€L°6T9CL
YL98T°EL
YL EYLTL
¥L'00ETL
SLLSSIL
ILYIVIL
9L 1L6°0L
LL8TSOL
LLS80°0L
LLTY9'69
8L661°69
8L9GL°89
8LETE 89
8L°0LSLY

€8l
81
181
081
6L1
8LI1
LLT
9LI1
CLI
VLI
eL1
CLT
ILT
0LT
691
891
L91
991
¢91
o1
€91
o1
191
091
651
861
LS
9¢1
el
12!
€Sl



88°LEY V6
10'991°v6
€I'v69°€6
9T TTTC6
6€0SL°T6
TS'8LTTO
¥9°908°16
9LYEETO
0679806
€0 16£°06
S1'616'68
8T LYY 68
0v'SL6°88
€57€05°88
L9T€0'88
6L°6SS°L8
16'L80°L8

09'169°88
19°8+C°88
09°608°L8
19°29¢°L8
19°616°98
19°9L¥°98
79°€€0°98
£9°065°S8
€9°LY1°S8
Y9 YOL Y8
9 19718
79°'818°€8
S9'GLEES
€9'TE6'T8
99'68%°C8
S9'9%0°C8
99°€09°18

$9'86S°LS
1L'8TELS
9L'8S0°LS
€8'88L°9¢
88815°9¢
¥6'8YC°9S
006L6°SS
90'60L°SS
11°6€1°SS
81°691°GS
€T6687S
6T 629YS
SE6SEYS
06801
9'618°¢S
TS6rses
8S°6LTES

69°1ST¥C
TL6SIYC
SLL90YT
8LSL6°ET
08'€88°¢T
Y8 16L°€T
L8'669°¢T
06°'L09°€T
v6'S1S°€T
96'€TY'€C
66 1€€°€T
0°0vCeT
SO'8P1°€T
80950°¢T
11¥96°CT
Y1TLYTT
L1°08LTT

L1°996°8C
SP'S€8'8T
0L'¥0L'8C
96'€LS"8C
€T EYY 8T
6V TIE8T
9L 181°8C
20°150°8¢
8T°0T6'LT
CC68L°LT
18'8S9°LT
90'8TS°LT
vEL6E LT
09'99T°LT
98'GEI°LT
€1°S00°LT
8€¥L8°9C

L1°996°8C
SP'SE8'8T
0L'¥0L'8C
96'€LS'8C
€TEYY 8T
6V TIE8T
9L 181°8C
20°'150°8¢
8T°0T6'LT
CC68L°LT
18'8S9°LT
90'8TS°LT
vEL6E LT
09'99T°LT
98°GEI°LT
€1°S00°LT
8€¥L8°9C

Tr'801°YC
LY610YC
76'0€6°€C
LT'TP8'ET
Y ESLET
L9Y99°€T
T6'SLS €T
8I'L8Y'ET
€'86£ €T
89'60€°€T
€6'0TT°€T
8I'TEIET
€V EP0°ET
89'S6°CT
€6'598°CC
8I'LLLTT
€1'889°CC

T0'LSTY8
LT°9€8°¢8
€eCIp'es
87668
¥9°€LS T8
6LTSIC8
Y6 1EL'TS
01 11¢18
ST068°08
17'691°08
SS'8¥0°08
1L°LT9'6L
L890T 6L
T0'98L°8L
L1°S9€°8L
TEVYO'LL
81" €TSLL

LTYLEOE
L6'09C°0€
6L°LY1°0€
09'€0°0¢
17" 176'6C
TT808°6C
€0°S69°6C
78 185°6¢C
99'89%°6C
9t'GSE°6C
8TTYT'6C
60°6C1°6C
06°S10°6C
1L°206°8C
TS68L°8C
€€'9L9°8C
S1'€95°'8T

L866579
01'v62°C9
7€'886'19
¥$T89°19
9L9LE'T9
86°0L0°19
0T'S9L°09
1765109
¥9°€S1°09
98°LY8°6S
80°TKS 6S
0€°9€T°6S
TS°0€6°8S
YL YT9°8S
96'81¢°8S
8I'€10°8S
0¥ LOL'LS

09°169°88
19°8%C°88
09°S08°L8
19°29¢°L8
19°616°98
19°9L1°98
79°€€0°98
€9°065°S8
€9°LY1°68
Y9 v0L Y8
Y9 19718
79°818°¢8
S9GLEES
$9T€6°C8
99°687°C8
$9°9t0°C8
99°€09°18

00¢
661
861
L6l
961
g6l
Y6l
€6l
[49!
161
06l
681
881
L8I
981
¢8I
¥81

10



3. In paragraph 8 (cracked trials and guilty pleas where the number of pages of prosecution
evidence exceeds the PPE Cut-off)(a), for the tables following sub-paragraph (2) (table of final
fees in cracked trials and table of final fees in guilty pleas), substitute the following—

“Table of final fees in cracked trials

Class of Offence ~ PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)

A 0-79 904.58 0

A 80-249 904.58 10.70

A 250-999 2,722.89 6.71

A 1000-2799 7,757.90 3.92

A 2800-4599 14,820.75 3.92

A 4600-6399 21,883.61 3.11

A 6400-8199 27,490.35 3.11

A 8200-9999 33,097.09 3.11

A 10,000 38,700.71 0

B 0-69 709.15 0

B 70-249 709.15 7.83

B 250-999 2,117.67 3.66

B 1000-2799 4,864.56 2.44

B 2800-4599 9,255.51 2.44

B 4600-6399 13,646.46 2.05

B 6400-8199 17,338.49 2.05

B 8200-9999 21,030.50 2.05

B 10,000 24,720.46 0

C 0-39 524.84 0

C 40-249 524.84 3.92

C 250-999 1,348.77 2.25

C 1000-2799 3,033.06 1.43

C 2800-4599 5,607.48 1.43

C 4600-6399 8,181.89 1.43

C 6400-8199 10,756.31 1.43

C 8200-9999 13,330.74 1.43

C 10,000 15,903.73 0

D 0-79 859.35 0

D 80-249 859.35 10.14

D 250-999 2,582.50 6.11

D 1000-2799 7,163.76 3.61

D 2800-4599 13,655.74 3.61

D 4600-6399 20,147.71 2.96

D 6400-8199 25,474.79 2.96

D 8200-9999 30,801.87 2.96

D 10,000 36,125.98 0

E 0-39 233.03 0

E 40-249 233.03 4.60

E 250-999 1,199.43 1.46

E 1000-2799 2,291.54 0.61

E 2800-4599 3,390.26 0.61

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).



4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-79
80-249
250-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-119
120-249
250-999
1000-2799

ARAARR T T S N S N S~ S S S S S S S NI I IIITITITIQQQAQAQAQAQQQT T T T T T T T T M M MM

12

4,488.97
5,587.69
6,686.41
7,784.51
224.22
224.22
1,107.53
2,450.39
3,704.67
4,958.94
6,213.21
7,467.49
8,721.06
224.22
22422
1,107.53
2,450.39
3,704.67
4,958.94
6,213.21
7,467.49
8,721.06
237.00
237.00
1,131.61
2,298.20
3,550.79
4,803.37
6,055.96
7,308.55
8,560.44
253.68
253.68
1,496.80
3,231.91
4,847.36
6,462.79
8,078.23
9,693.67
11,308.20
904.58
904.58
2,722.89
7,757.90
14,820.75
21,883.61
27,490.35
33,097.09
38,700.71
773.86
773.86
1,624.85
5,388.98

0.61
0.61
0.61

4.42
1.79
0.70
0.70
0.70
0.70
0.70

4.42
1.79
0.70
0.70
0.70
0.70
0.70

4.26
1.56
0.70
0.70
0.70
0.70
0.70

5.92
2.31
0.90
0.90
0.90
0.90
0.90

10.70
6.71
3.92
3.92
3.11
3.11
3.11

6.55
5.02
4.39



K 2800-4599 13,299.04 4.39
K 4600-6399 21,209.12 3.75
K 6400-8199 27,954.29 3.75
K 8200-9999 34,699.46 3.75
K 10,000 41,440.89 0
Table of final fees in guilty pleas
Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page of prosecution
evidence (£)
A 0-79 680.39 0
A 80-399 680.39 5.62
A 400-999 2,478.29 2.96
A 1000-2799 4,256.09 1.89
A 2800-4599 7,666.89 1.89
A 4600-6399 11,077.68 1.12
A 6400-8199 13,090.60 1.12
A 8200-9999 15,103.53 1.12
A 10,000 17,115.33 0
B 0-69 556.11 0
B 70-399 556.11 4.52
B 400-999 2,046.59 2.28
B 1000-2799 3,411.75 1.45
B 2800-4599 6,025.92 1.45
B 4600-6399 8,640.11 1.06
B 6400-8199 10,555.35 1.06
B 8200-9999 12,470.60 1.06
B 10,000 14,384.78 0
C 0-39 44291 0
C 40-399 44291 2.66
C 400-999 1,401.88 1.46
C 1000-2799 2,276.27 0.79
C 2800-4599 3,699.93 0.79
C 4600-6399 5,123.61 0.79
C 6400-8199 6,547.28 0.79
C 8200-9999 7,970.95 0.79
C 10,000 9,393.82 0
D 0-79 646.36 0
D 80-399 646.36 5.23
D 400-999 2,320.66 2.75
D 1000-2799 3,968.37 1.71
D 2800-4599 7,046.20 1.71
D 4600-6399 10,124.03 1.06
D 6400-8199 12,036.98 1.06
D 8200-9999 13,949.91 1.06
D 10,000 15,861.79 0
E 0-39 184.70 0
E 40-399 184.70 2.92
E 400-999 1,237.24 1.25
E 1000-2799 1,989.07 0.46
E 2800-4599 2,819.70 0.46
E 4600-6399 3,650.33 0.46
E 6400-8199 4,480.96 0.46

13



ARARAARS S S S SSsssm s s s FODDIDIT I TR IQQQQQmTH ™™™ ™™ ™o

8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-49
50-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-39
40-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-79
80-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399
6400-8199
8200-9999
10,000
0-119
120-399
400-999
1000-2799
2800-4599
4600-6399

14

5,311.59
6,141.75
195.81
195.81
1,187.73
1,781.21
2,354.07
2,926.93
3,499.78
4,072.64
4,645.18
195.81
195.81
1,187.73
1,781.21
2,354.07
2,926.93
3,499.78
4,072.64
4,645.18
190.97
190.97
1,196.59
1,790.74
2,359.85
2,928.98
3,498.10
4,067.22
4,636.00
174.60
174.60
1,298.52
2,116.29
3,033.02
3,949.75
4,866.48
5,783.22
6,699.45
680.39
680.39
2,478.29
4,256.09
7,666.89
11,077.68
13,090.60
15,103.53
17,115.33
640.84
640.84
2,113.13
3,869.24
8,775.55
13,681.86

0.46

2.83
0.99
0.32
0.32
0.32
0.32
0.32

2.83
0.99
0.32
0.32
0.32
0.32
0.32

2.79
0.99
0.32
0.32
0.32
0.32
0.32

3.12
1.36
0.51
0.51
0.51
0.51
0.51

5.62
2.96
1.89
1.89
1.12
1.12
1.12

5.26
2.93
2.73
2.73
2.08



K 6400-8199 17,423.28 2.08
K 8200-9999 21,164.71 2.08
K 10,000 24,904.04 0.

4. In paragraph 9 (trials where the number of pages of prosecution evidence exceeds the PPE
Cut-off)(a), for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (table of final fees in trials), substitute the
following

“Class of Offence PPE Range Initial Fee (£) Incremental fee per
page (£)
A 0-79 1,467.58 0
A 80-209 1,467.58 16.58
A 210-699 3,622.54 12.66
A 700-1049 9,824.91 10.62
A 1050-1999 13,543.42 9.21
A 2000-3599 22,295.42 8.42
A 3600-5199 35,767.03 8.42
A 5200-6799 49,238.64 8.42
A 6800-8399 62,710.26 8.42
A 8400-9999 76,181.87 8.42
A 10,000 89,645.06 0
B 0-69 1,097.66 0
B 70-199 1,097.66 12.81
B 200-499 2,762.60 11.44
B 500-899 6,195.38 9.63
B 900-1299 10,048.21 8.09
B 1300-1999 13,285.03 7.09
B 2000-3299 18,249.51 7.09
B 3300-4999 27,469.24 7.09
B 5000-5999 39,525.82 7.09
B 6000-7999 46,617.93 7.09
B 8000-8999 60,802.14 7.09
B 9000-9999 67,894.24 7.09
B 10,000 74,979.26 0
C 0-39 739.59 0
C 40-299 739.59 10.57
C 300-799 3,486.54 9.23
C 800-1249 8,101.74 7.73
C 1250-1999 11,578.09 6.83
C 2000-3199 16,700.93 4.72
C 3200-4559 22,368.79 4.72
C 4560-5919 28,792.38 4.72
C 5920-7279 35,215.96 4.72
C 7280-8639 41,639.54 4.72
C 8640-9999 48,063.12 4.72
C 10,000 54,482.00 0
D 0-79 1,394.20 0
D 80-209 1,394.20 15.75
D 210-699 3,441.41 12.03
D 700-1049 9,333.67 10.09
D 1050-1999 12,866.25 8.75

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).

15



el sl o lic ol slie slicslicolicsficsiicslic o lcs MO N NO RO RO NS RO RO RO o No B leslesHesHesliesleslesle sl slieslesMeslesliesleslesHesHesMesles e RolvlvBo R ol

2000-3599
3600-5199
5200-6799
6800-8399
8400-9999
10,000
0-39

40-69
70-129
130-599
600-1349
1350-2999
3000-4749
4750-6499
6500-8249
8250-9999
10,000
0-49
50-229
230-699
700-1399
1400-1949
1950-3549
3550-5149
5150-6749
6750-8349
8350-9999
10,000
0-49
50-229
230-699
700-1399
1400-1949
1950-3549
3550-5149
5150-6749
6750-8349
8350-9999
10,000
0-39
40-249
250-619
620-1299
1300-2999
3000-4999
5000-5999
6000-6999
7000-7999
8000-8999
9000-9999
10,000
0-39
40-369

16

21,180.65
33,978.67
46,776.70
59,574.74
72,372.77
85,162.80
352.72
352.72
638.20
1,152.58
5,049.74
9,131.96
13,072.77
17,252.41
21,432.04
25,611.69
29,788.93
357.60
357.60
1,673.21
4,946.64
8,865.80
11,242.37
14,691.41
18,140.45
21,589.49
25,038.53
28,593.21
357.60
357.60
1,673.21
4,946.64
8,865.80
11,242.37
14,691.41
18,140.45
21,589.49
25,038.53
28,593.21
357.75
357.75
2,162.92
4,807.79
8,418.74
15,583.59
20,129.84
22,402.90
24,676.03
26,949.15
29,222.28
31,493.13
357.44
357.44

8.00
8.00
8.00
8.00
8.00

9.52
8.57
8.29
5.44
2.39
2.39
2.39
2.39
2.39

7.31
6.96
5.60
4.32
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16

7.31
6.96
5.60
4.32
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16
2.16

8.60
7.15
5.31
4.21
227
2.27
227
2.27
2.27
2.27

9.14



I 370-799 3,373.66 9.09
I 800-1299 7,282.43 8.99
I 1300-2699 11,779.02 7.08
I 2700-4199 21,697.63 3.04
I 4200-5359 26,264.52 3.04
I 5360-6519 29,796.25 3.04
I 6520-7679 33,327.97 3.04
I 7680-8839 36,859.71 3.04
I 8840-9999 40,391.43 3.04
I 10,000 43,920.11 0

J 0-79 1,467.58 0

J 80-209 1,467.58 16.58
J 210-699 3,622.54 12.66
J 700-1049 9,824.91 10.62
J 1050-1999 13,543.42 9.21
J 2000-3599 22,295.42 8.42
J 3600-5199 35,767.03 8.42
J 5200-6799 49,238.64 8.42
J 6800-8399 62,710.26 8.42
J 8400-9999 76,181.87 8.42
J 10,000 89,645.06 0

K 0-119 1,031.82 0

K 120-734 1,031.82 8.66
K 735-1289 6,356.06 8.72
K 1290-2399 11,193.67 8.87
K 2400-4499 21,042.53 8.84
K 4500-7999 39,605.74 8.84
K 8000-8399 70,544.40 8.84
K 8400-8799 74,080.24 8.84
K 8800-9199 77,616.08 8.84
K 9200-9599 81,151.94 8.84
K 9600-9999 84,687.78 8.84
K 10,000 88,214.79 0.

5.In paragraph 11 (fixed fee for guilty pleas or cracked trials)(a), for “£298.65” substitute
“£330.33”.

6. For the table following paragraph 19 (fixed fees)(b), substitute the following—

“Types of proceedings Paragraph Fee payable -
providing for (£ per
Jee proceedings)
Appeal against sentence from a magistrates’ court 15 155.32
Appeal against conviction from a magistrates’ court 15 349.47
Committal for sentence 15 232.98
Hearing subsequent to sentence 16 155.32
Contempt proceedings (where contempt is alleged 17(2) 116.49
to have been committed by a person other than the
defendant)
Alleged breach of a Crown Court Order 18(2) 77.66”.

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369.
(b) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369.

17



7. For the table following paragraph 27 (prescribed fee rates)(a), substitute the following—

“Class of work Grade of fee earner  Rate Variations
Preparation Senior solicitor £48.36 per £50.87 per hour for a fee
hour earner whose office is
situated within the City of
London or a London
borough
Solicitor, legal £41.06 per £43.12 per hour for a fee
executive or fee hour earner whose office is
earner of equivalent situated within the City of
experience London or a London
borough
Trainee or fee earner  £27.15 per £31.03 per hour for a fee
of equivalent hour earner whose office is
experience situated within the City of
London or a London
borough
Attendance at Senior solicitor £38.55 per
court where more hour
than one
representative
instructed
Solicitor, legal £31.03 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £18.71 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Travelling and Senior solicitor £22.58 per
waiting hour
Solicitor, legal £22.58 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £11.41 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Writing routine £3.15 per £3.29 per item for a fee
letters and dealing item earner whose office is

with routine
telephone calls

situated within the City of
London or a London
borough”.

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369.

18



SCHEDULE 2 Regulation 4(3)

Amendments to Schedule 3 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations

1. For the table following paragraph 7(1) (litigators’ fees for proceedings in the Court of
Appeal)(a), substitute the following—

“Class of work Grade of fee earner  Rate Variations
Preparation Senior solicitor £48.36 per £50.87 per hour for a
hour litigator whose office is

situated within the City
of London or a London

borough
Solicitor, legal £41.06 per £43.12 per hour for a
executive or fee hour litigator whose office is
earner of equivalent situated within the City
experience of London or a London
borough
Trainee or fee earner  £27.15 per £31.03 per hour for a
of equivalent hour litigator whose office is
experience situated within the City
of London or a London
borough
Advocacy Senior Solicitor £58.40 per
hour
Solicitor £51.10 per
hour
Attendance at Senior Solicitor £38.55 per
court where more hour
than one
representative
assigned
Solicitor, legal £31.03 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £18.71 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Travelling and Senior Solicitor £22.58 per
waiting hour
Solicitor, legal £22.58 per
executive or fee hour
earner of equivalent
experience
Trainee or fee earner  £11.41 per
of equivalent hour
experience
Routine letters £3.15 peritem £3.29 per item for a
written and routine litigator whose office is

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369.

19



telephone calls situated within the City
of London or a London
borough”.

SCHEDULE 3 Regulation 4(4)

Amendments to Schedule 4 to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations
1. For “£1,237.50”, wherever it appears, substitute “£1,368.75”.
2.In paragraph 2 (work conducted at the Police Station: Police Station advice and
assistance)(a)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1)—
(1) in paragraph (a), for “£25.95” substitute “£28.70”, and
(ii) in paragraph (b), for “£24.96” substitute “£27.60”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (2), for “£6.60” substitute “£7.30”;
(c) for the table following sub-paragraph (3), substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)

Police Station attendance hourly rates

Own or Duty Solicitor £51.28 £47.45
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) £63.01 £63.01
Duty Solicitor — serious offence rate £59.31 £54.75
Duty Solicitor — serious offence rate (Unsocial Hours) £73.00 £73.00
Travel and waiting hourly rates

Own Solicitor £26.28 £26.28
Duty Solicitor £51.28 £47.45
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) £63.01 £63.017,

and

(d) for the table following sub-paragraph (8) (Police Station attendance — fixed fees and
escape fee thresholds), substitute the following—

“Criminal Justice System Scheme Fixed Escape Fee
Area Fee (£) Threshold
&)
Cleveland Hartlepool 131.40 405.40
Teesside 135.96 417.03
Durham Darlington 154.54 463.62
South Durham 152.39 468.28
Durham 177.94 554.48
Derwentside 171.63 514.90
Easington 166.99 512.54
Northumbria South East Northumberland 148.33 444 98
Newcastle upon Tyne 137.79 424.01
Gateshead 142.90 428.69
North Tyneside 140.53 431.02
South Tyneside 133.23 410.05

Sunderland / Houghton Le Spring  148.74 458.97

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).

20



Avon & Somerset

Dorset

Wiltshire

Gloucestershire

Devon & Cornwall

Staffordshire

Warwickshire
West Mercia

West Midlands

Dyfed Powys

Gwent

Berwick & Alnwick
Tynedale & Hexham

Avon North & Thornbury
Bath

Mendip & South Somerset
Bristol

Sedgemore / Taunton Deane
Weston-Super-Mare

Central Dorset

Bournemouth & Christchurch
Poole East Dorset

Bridport / West Dorset
Salisbury

Chippenham / Trowbridge
Swindon

Cheltenham

Gloucester

Stroud

Barnstaple

Exeter

Plymouth

East Cornwall

Carrick / Kerrier (Camborne) /
Penwith

Teignbridge / Torbay

Stoke on Trent / Leek
Stafford / Cannock & Rugeley
Lichfield & Tamworth / Burton
Upon Trent / Uttoxeter
Leamington / Nuneaton / Rugby
Hereford / Leominster
Kidderminster / Redditch
Shrewsbury

Telford

Worcester

Sandwell

Wolverhampton & Seisdon
Dudley & Halesowen
Walsall

Birmingham

Solihull

Coventry

Amman Valley

Carmarthen East Dyfed
Llanelli

Brecon & Radnor

Mid Wales

North Ceredigion / South
Ceredigion

Pembrokeshire

East Gwent

Newport

Lower Rhymney Valley / North

21

177.03
154.21
177.94
193.37
216.67
159.98
181.59
180.95
182.50
145.22
153.30
146.00
174.29
187.94
171.55
157.86
155.13
177.94
173.96
154.54
179.40
198.93
177.94

163.17
177.94
177.94
172.46

178.61
155.32
198.81
166.08
172.46
180.95
176.11
176.11
173.18
177.94
177.94
187.16
153.77
177.94
201.92
138.70
203.47
155.32
204.24

166.99
169.73
166.99
177.94

545.17
475.28
561.49
580.10
650.02
479.94
615.06
542.85
547.50
435.67
470.60
438.00
535.84
563.82
528.86
486.92
477.61
547.50
521.88
463.62
538.19
675.64
563.82

489.25
563.82
547.50
531.18

535.84
465.95
596.42
510.22
531.18
542.85
540.52
540.52
519.55
549.83
566.14
561.49
461.30
570.80
605.75
426.34
610.41
465.95
612.73

514.90
521.88
512.54
556.81



North Wales

South Wales

Merseyside

Cheshire

Cumbria

Greater Manchester

Lancashire

Kent

Bedwellty/ South Bedwellty
Bangor & Caernarfon
Colwyn Bay

Denbighshire

Dolgellau

Mold & Hawarden

North Anglesey

Pwllheli

Wrexham

Cardiff

Vale of Glamorgan

Cynon Valley

Mid Glamorgan & Miskin
Merthyr Tydfil

Port Talbot

Newcastle & Ogmore
Neath

Swansea

Bootle & Crosby

Southport

Liverpool

St Helens

Knowsley

Wirral

Crewe & Nantwich / Sandbach &
Congleton / Macclesfield
Warrington / Halton
Chester / Vale Royal (Northwich)
Barrow in Furness

Kendal & Windermere
Penrith / Carlisle
Whitehaven / Workington
Manchester

Stockport

Trafford

Salford

Bolton

Bury

Wigan

Rochdale / Middleton
Tameside

Oldham

Burnley / Rossendale
Blackburn / Accrington / Ribble
Valley

Blackpool

Fleetwood

Lancaster

Chorley / Ormskirk / South Ribble
& Leyland

Preston

Dartford & Gravesend
Ashford & Tenterden / Dover /

22

189.49
173.38
188.71
188.71
177.94
197.26
133.57
161.53
177.94
208.13
177.94
177.94
177.94
219.00
177.94
180.68
171.55
162.43
135.91
179.40
153.30
165.16
157.86
176.11

154.54
160.76
153.77
183.28
173.18
143.67
177.94
167.74
177.94
177.94
164.64
159.98
170.07
169.30
156.04
137.46
162.31
177.94

126.58
129.69
159.20
174.73

142.90
232.98
205.31

568.47
533.51
566.14
566.14
554.48
591.77
400.72
484.59
587.11
624.40
563.82
587.11
582.46
740.88
596.42
612.73
528.86
498.58
407.72
538.19
472.96
507.89
484.59
540.52

463.62
482.27
461.30
549.83
519.55
431.02
587.11
503.23
559.16
570.80
493.93
479.94
510.22
507.89
479.94
412.38
486.92
580.10

379.75
389.08
477.61
524.20

428.69
698.94
696.61



Surrey

Sussex

Derbyshire

Leicestershire

Lincolnshire

Nottinghamshire

Northamptonshire

Bedfordshire

Cambridgeshire

Essex

Folkestone

Medway

Swale

Maidstone & West Malling
Canterbury / Thanet

West Kent (Tonbridge)
Guildford & Farnham
North West Surrey (Woking)
South East Surrey

Epsom

Staines

Brighton & Hove & Lewes
Chichester & District
Crawley / Horsham
Hastings

Worthing

Eastbourne

East Derbyshire (Ripley) /
Ilkeston

Ashbourne / Matlock / High Peak
(Buxton)

Chesterfield

Derby / Swadlincote
Ashby & Coalville /

Loughborough / Melton Mowbray

Leicester

Hinckley / Market Harborough
Boston, Bourne, Stamford
Skegness

Lincoln / Gainsborough
Grantham & Sleaford
Mansfield

Newark

Nottingham

Worksop & East Retford
Corby (Kettering) /
Wellingborough
Northampton

Bedford

Luton

Cambridge

Ely

Huntingdon

March & Wisbech
Peterborough

Basildon

Brentwood

Braintree

Clacton & Harwich / Colchester
Grays

Harlow & Loughton
Stansted

Rayleigh / Southend on Sea

23

205.02
243.07
216.67
177.94
208.13
179.76
196.19
207.14
209.88
240.90
183.41
162.43
228.32
142.35
164.25
173.18
206.57

190.27

177.84
177.94
181.72

177.94
201.92
173.38
156.09
161.53
159.69
160.60
180.17
179.40
170.64
157.65

170.85
167.90
177.94
162.43
177.94
173.18
171.63
142.90
177.94
249.11
198.93
177.94
232.69
232.69
257.33
166.97

615.06
729.22
650.02
603.43
624.40
610.41
666.31
703.59
712.93
815.42
622.04
498.58
684.95
438.00
505.56
519.55
619.72

570.80

533.51
570.80
545.17

552.15
605.75
533.51
468.28
484.59
491.57
493.93
540.52
538.19
524.20
472.96

512.54
517.22
601.07
500.91
575.45
519.55
514.90
428.69
549.83
845.72
673.32
563.82
789.80
789.80
873.67
500.91



Hertfordshire

Norfolk

Suffolk

Thames Valley

Hampshire

Humberside

North Yorkshire

South Yorkshire

Chelmsford / Witham
Dacorum (Hemel Hempstead)

Bishop’s Stortford / East
Hertfordshire

Stevenage & North Hertfordshire
St. Albans

Watford

Cromer & North Walsham
Great Yarmouth

Kings Lynn & West Norfolk
Norwich & District

Diss / Thetford

Dereham

Lowestoft / Beccles & Halesworth
/ Aldeburgh

Felixstowe / Ipswich & District /
Woodbridge

Sudbury & Hadleigh / Bury St.
Edmunds / Haverhill / Newmarket
Abingdon, Didcot & Witney
(South Oxfordshire)

Aylesbury

High Wycombe & Amersham
Milton Keynes

Bicester / North Oxon (Banbury)
Oxford

Reading

Slough (East Berkshire)

West Berkshire (Newbury etc.)
Aldershot / Petersfield (North East
Hampshire)

Andover / Basingstoke /
Winchester (North West
Hampshire)

Isle of Wight

Portsmouth / Waterlooville (South
East Hampshire)

Gosport & Fareham
Southampton (South West
Hampshire)

Grimsby & Cleethorpes
Scunthorpe

Hull

Beverley / Bridlington

Goole

Northallerton & Richmond
Harrogate & Ripon

Skipton, Settle & Ingleton
Scarborough / Whitby

Malton & Rydale

York / Selby

Barnsley

Doncaster

Rotherham

24

176.11
209.88
254.59

236.34
214.44
210.79
184.33
168.52
164.64
169.30
175.20
198.01
169.30

172.41

177.94

208.96

198.81
190.71
165.16
194.36
194.36
188.71
208.96
174.73
199.84

210.46

171.63
176.29

215.11
198.81

134.35
144.18
153.30
177.94
182.50
191.82
184.05
177.94
152.39
146.78
159.69
158.78
153.30
162.43

542.85
710.57
864.34

801.46
702.25
715.25
624.40
505.56
493.93
507.89
538.19
670.99
507.89

517.22

552.15

708.25

596.42
647.69
507.89
659.33
659.33
566.14
708.25
524.20
677.97

631.38

514.90
528.86

645.34
596.42

403.04
444.98
470.60
587.11
617.39
575.45
552.15
547.50
468.28
440.33
491.57
489.25
470.60
500.91



Sheffield 166.99 514.90

West Yorkshire Halifax 173.96 521.88
Huddersfield 146.78 440.33
Dewsbury 159.20 477.61
Bradford 135.96 419.36
Keighley & Bingley 153.30 470.60
Leeds 144.18 442.65
Pontefract & Castleford 141.34 424.01
Wakefield 139.61 428.69

London Barking 224.48 761.85
Bexley 200.75 680.30
Bishopsgate 234.51 794.45
Brent 219.00 740.88
Brentford 222.65 754.84
Bromley 211.70 717.58
Camberwell Green 219.00 743.20
Central London 237.25 803.78
Clerkenwell / Hampstead 221.74 750.18
Croydon 216.26 731.54
Ealing 229.95 780.67
Enfield 218.09 738.55
Greenwich / Woolwich 208.96 708.25
Haringey 225.39 764.17
Harrow 219.00 743.20
Havering 204.40 691.96
Heathrow 274.66 931.93
Hendon / Barnet 220.83 747.86
Highbury Corner 229.95 778.16
Kingston-Upon-Thames 228.13 773.48
Newham 219.91 745.53
Old Street 219.00 743.20
Redbridge 225.39 764.17
Richmond-Upon-Thames 240.90 815.42
South London 229.95 778.16
Sutton 218.09 738.55
Thames 218.09 738.55
Tower Bridge 232.69 789.80
Uxbridge 210.79 715.25
Waltham Forest 204.40 694.28
West London 23543 799.10
Wimbledon 223.56 757.19”.

3. In paragraph 3 (work conducted outside the Police Station)(a)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (1), for “£247.50” substitute “£273.75”;

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (free standing advice and assistance), substitute
the following—

“London (£) National (£)

Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per 3.51 3.38

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).

25



item
Preparation hourly rate 45.35
Travel and waiting hourly rate 24.00

42.80
24.007;

(c) for the tables following sub-paragraph (2) (Advocacy Assistance on a warrant of further
detention — Magistrates’ Court or judicial authority and Advocacy Assistance on a
warrant of further detention — High Court or a senior judge), including the headings to the

tables, substitute the following—

“Table A
Advocacy Assistance on a warrant of further detention — magistrates’ court or judicial
authority

London (£) National (£)
Routine letters written and telephone calls (per item)
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 3.51 3.38
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 4.65 4.47
Preparation hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 45.35 42.80
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 60.50 57.03
Advocacy hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 53.84 53.84
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) T1.77 71.77
Travelling and waiting hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 24.00 24.00
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 31.98 31.98
Table B

Advocacy Assistance on a warrant of further detention — High Court or a senior judge

London  National

€9) €]
Routine letter out per item 6.84 6.84
Routine telephone calls per item 3.79 3.79
All other preparation work, hourly rate 72.54 68.44
Attending counsel in conference or at the trial or hearing of any 33.76 33.76
summons or application at court or other appointment, hourly rate
Attending without counsel at the trial or hearing of any cause or 68.44 68.44
the hearing of any summons or application at court, or other
appointment, hourly rate
Travelling and waiting, hourly rate 30.34 30.347;

(d) for the table following sub-paragraph (3) (Advocacy Assistance for armed forces custody

hearings), substitute the following—

« National
London (£)
&)
Routine letters written and telephone calls (per item)
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 3.51 3.38
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours) 4.65 4.47
Preparation hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor 45.35 42.80

26



Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours)
Advocacy hourly rate

Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours)
Travelling and waiting hourly rate
Own Solicitor and Duty Solicitor
Duty Solicitor (Unsocial Hours)

60.50

53.84
71.77

24.00
31.98

57.03

53.84
71.77

24.00
31.987,

and

(e) for the table following sub-paragraph (4) (Advocacy Assistance in the magistrates’ court
in connection with an application to vary police bail conditions), substitute the

following—
“London National (£)
€9)
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item 3.70 3.56
Preparation hourly rate 47.95 45.35
Advocacy hourly rate 56.89 56.89
Travelling and waiting hourly rate 24.00 24.00 .

4. In paragraph 4 (Advice and Assistance and Advocacy Assistance by a court Duty Solicitor

and Advocacy Assistance at the Virtual Court)(a)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (Advice and Assistance and Advocacy

Assistance by a court Duty Solicitor), substitute the following—

“London National (£)
€9)
Standard hourly rate (attendance and waiting at a 50.32 49.14
magistrates’ court)
Enhanced hourly rate (only payable in respect of work done  62.87 61.41
on a day which is not a Business Day)
Travelling hourly rate (only payable where the Duty 24.00 24.007,

Solicitor is called out (including being called to return) to
the court from the Office or attends on a day that is not a
Business Day. Reasonable travel expenses may also be
claimed (where relevant)).

and

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (Advocacy Assistance at the Virtual Court),

substitute the following—

“London  National (£)
#)
Virtual Court Fixed Fee where the hearing is held during 182.50 136.88
Business Hours
Virtual Court Fixed Fee where the hearing is held during 219.00 164.25”.

Unsocial hours

5. In paragraph 5 (representation in the magistrates’ court)(b)—

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).
(b) Amended by S.I. 2014/415, 2015/325, 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations,

subject to the exceptions in regulation 3) and 2015/1678.

27



(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (representation in a magistrates’ court),
substitute the following—

“All
Areas
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item £3.56
Preparation hourly rate £45.35
Advocacy hourly rate (including applications for bail and other applications to ~ £56.89
the court)
Hourly rate for attendance at court where Counsel is assigned (including £31.03

conferences with Counsel at court)
Travelling and waiting hourly rate (only claimable where the undesignated area  £24.00”,
fees apply)

and

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (Higher and Lower Standard Fees table),
substitute the following—

“Lower Lower Higher Higher
Standard Fee Standard Fee Standard Fee Standard Fee
(£) Limit (£) (£) Limit (£)
Designated Area Standard Fees
Category 1A 248.71 272.34 471.81 471.85
Category 1B 202.20 272.34 435.64 471.85
Category 2 345.34 467.84 723.35 779.64
Undesignated Area Standard Fees
Category 1A 194.68 272.34 412.30 471.85
Category 1B 158.27 272.34 380.70 471.85
Category 2 279.45 467.84 640.94 779.64”.

6. In paragraph 5A (representation in proceedings relating to an injunction under Part 1 of the
2014 Act or related parenting order in any court)(a)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (representation in proceedings relating to an
injunction under Part 1 of the 2014 Act or related parenting order in any court), substitute
the following—

“All
Areas
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item £3.56
Preparation hourly rate £45.35
Advocacy hourly rate (including applications for bail and other applications to ~ £56.89
the court)
Hourly rate for attendance at court where Counsel is assigned (including £31.037;

conferences with Counsel at court)

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (3) (Higher and Lower Fees Table), substitute the

following—
“Lower fee (£) Lower  fee Higher fee Higher fee limit
limit (£) (£) (£)
Uncontested 158.27 272.34 380.70 471.85
Contested 279.45 467.84 640.94 779.64”,

(a) Inserted by S.I. 2015/325. Amended by S.I. 2015/1369.

28



and
(c) in sub-paragraph (4) for “£21.70” substitute “£24.00”.

7. In paragraph 6 (own client work)(a)—
(a) in sub-paragraph (2)—
(i) in paragraph (a), for “£43.35” substitute “£47.95”, and
(i1) in paragraph (b), for “41.00” substitute “£45.35”;
(b) in sub-paragraph (3), for “£61.88” substitute “£68.44";
(c) in sub-paragraph (4) for “£20.63” substitute “£22.81”, and

(d) for the table following sub-paragraph (4) (own client work), including the heading to the
table, substitute the following—

“Work undertaken prior to a determination that an individual is not eligible for
criminal legal aid

London (£) National

€9)
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item 3.70 3.56
Preparation hourly rate 47.95 45.35
Advocacy (including applications for bail and other 56.89 56.89
applications to the court) hourly rate
Travelling and waiting hourly rate (only applicable where the N/A 24.00”.

Undesignated Area fees apply)

8.In paragraph 7 (representation in proceedings prescribed as criminal proceedings under
section 14(h) of the Act)(b)—

(a) for the table following sub-paragraph (1) (representation in prescribed proceedings in a
Crown Court), substitute the following table—

“London (£) National (£)

Routine letters written and telephone calls per item  3.70 3.56

Preparation hourly rate 47.95 45.35

Advocacy hourly rate 56.89 56.89

Travelling and waiting hourly rate 24.00 24.00”,
and

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (representation in prescribed proceedings in the
High Court or a county court), substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)
Routine letters out per item 6.84 6.02
Routine telephone calls per item 3.79 3.33
All other preparation work hourly rate 68.44 (72.54 60.23 (63.88
where Provider’s ~ where Provider’s
office is in office is in
London) London)
Attending counsel in conference or at the trial or 33.76 29.66
hearing of any summons or application at court or
other appointment — hourly rate
Attending without counsel at the trial or hearing 68.44 60.23

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).
(b) Amended by S.I. 2014/415, 2015/325 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).

29



of any cause or the hearing of any summons or

other application at court or other appointment —

hourly rate

Travelling and waiting hourly rate 30.34

26.65".

9. In paragraph 8 (Advice and Assistance on an appeal against conviction or sentence or an

application to the Criminal Cases Review Commission)(a)—
(a) in paragraph (a), for “£247.50” substitute “£273.75”;
(b) in paragraph (b), for “£412.50” substitute “£456.25”, and

(c) for the table following paragraph 8 (Advice and Assistance on an appeal against
conviction or sentence or application to the Criminal Cases Review Commission),

substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls ~ 3.51 3.38
per item
Preparation hourly rate 45.35 42.80
Travel and waiting hourly rate 24.00 24.00”.

10. In paragraph 9 (representation on an appeal by way of case stated)(b), for the table following
sub-paragraph (1) (representation on an appeal by way of case stated in the High Court), substitute

the following—

“High Court (£)

Routine letters out per item
Routine telephone calls per item

All other preparation work — hourly rate

Attending counsel in conference or at the trial or hearing of any
summons or application at court or other appointment — hourly rate
Attending without counsel at the trial or hearing of any cause or the
hearing of any summons or other application at court or other
appointment — hourly rate

Travelling and waiting hourly rate

6.84
3.79

68.44 (72.54
where the
Provider’s office
is in London)
33.76

68.44

30.34”.

11. For the table following paragraph 10 (representation in the Crown Court on an appeal from a
magistrates’ court in proceedings prescribed as criminal proceedings under section 14(h) of the

Act)(c), substitute the following—

“London (£) National (£)
Routine letters written and telephone calls per item  3.70 3.56
Preparation hourly rate 47.95 45.35
Advocacy hourly rate 56.89 56.89
Travelling and waiting hourly rate 24.00 24.00”.

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).

(b) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369.

(c) Amended by S.I. 2014/415, 2015/325 and 2015/1369 (Part 3 of which is revoked by regulation 2(a) of these Regulations).

30



12. In paragraph 11 (Advice and Assistance provided pursuant to a determination made under
section 15 of the Act in Prison Law cases)(a)—

(a) in sub-paragraph (1), for—
(i) “£181.50” substitute “£200.75”, and
(ii) “£544.50” substitute “£602.25”;

(b) for the table following sub-paragraph (2) (hourly rates for determining whether Escape
Fee Threshold reached), substitute the following—

“All areas (£)

Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per item 3.38
Preparation hourly rate 42.80
Travel and waiting hourly rate 24.007;

(c) for the tables following sub-paragraph (3) (hourly rates in Disciplinary Cases for
determining application of Standard Fees and Higher and Lower Standard Fees table for
Disciplinary Cases), including the headings to the tables, substitute the following—

“Hourly rates in Disciplinary Cases for determining application of Standard Fees

All areas (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per item 3.70
Preparation hourly rate 51.24
Advocacy hourly rate 62.28
Travel and waiting hourly rate 24.00

(a) Amended by S.I. 2013/2803, 2014/415 and 2015/1369.

31



Higher and Lower Standard Fees table for Disciplinary Cases

Lower Standard Lower Standard Higher Standard Higher Standard Fee
Fee (£) Fee Limit (£) Fee (£) Limit (£)
203.93 357.06 564.16 1,691.69”,

and

(d) for the tables following sub-paragraph (4) (hourly rates in Parole Board Cases for
determining application of Standard Fees and Higher and Lower Standard Fees table for
Parole Board Cases), including the headings to the tables, substitute the following—

“Hourly rates in Parole Board Cases for determining application of Standard Fees

All areas (£)
Routine letters written and routine telephone calls per item 3.70
Preparation hourly rate 51.24
Advocacy hourly rate 62.28
Travel and waiting hourly rate 24.00
Higher and Lower Standard Fees table for Parole Board Cases
Lower Standard Lower Standard Higher  Standard Higher  Standard
Fee (£) Fee Limit (£) Fee (£) Fee Limit (£)
437.21 933.93 1,454.44 4,362.54”.

13. In paragraph 12 (payment for Assigned Counsel)(a), for the table following sub-paragraph
(2) (payment for Assigned Counsel), substitute the following—

“Junior Queen’s
Counsel (£) Counsel (£)
Basic fee for preparation, including for a pre-trial maximum maximum
review and, where appropriate, the first day’s hearing amount: amount:
including, where they took place on that day, short 427.00 4,056.00
conferences, consultations, applications and
appearances (including bail applications, views and any
other preparation).
Refresher daily fee (for any day or part of a day during ~ maximum maximum
which a hearing continued, including, where they took amount: amount:
place on that day, short conferences, consultations, 147.00 271.01
applications and appearances (including bail
applications, views and any other preparation).
Subsidiary fees:
Attendance at consultations, conferences and views not  26.69 per hour  49.73 per hour
covered by the basic fee or the refresher fee. — minimum — minimum
amount: 13.25  amount 25.55
Written work (on evidence, plea, appeal, case stated or ~ maximum maximum
other written work). amount: 46.77  amount: 95.81
Attendance at pre-trial reviews, applications and other maximum maximum
appearances (including bail applications and amount: 85.78  amount:
adjournments for sentence) not covered by the basic fee 187.06”.

or the refresher fee.

(a) Amended by S.I. 2014/415 and 2015/1369.

32



EXPLANATORY NOTE

(This note is not part of the Regulations)

This instrument amends the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration) Regulations 2013 (S.I. 2013/435)
(“the Criminal Remuneration Regulations”), which provide for the remuneration of advice,
assistance and representation made available under sections 13, 15 and 16 of the Legal Aid,
Sentencing and Punishment of Offenders Act 2012 (c. 10) (“the Act”).

The Criminal Remuneration Regulations were amended by the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration
etc.) (Amendment) Regulations 2015 (S.I. 2015/1369) (“the Amending Regulations”), which were
amended by the Criminal Legal Aid (Remuneration etc.) (Amendment) (No.2) Regulations 2015
(S.I. 2015/2049). The Amending Regulations amend the fees payable under the Criminal
Remuneration Regulations in two respects: reducing fees under existing fee schemes (Part 2 of the
Amending Regulations) and introducing new fixed fee schemes (Part 3 of the Amending
Regulations), along with amendments consequential on the introduction of new contracts for the
provision of services made available under sections 13, 15 and 16 of the Act. Part 3 also makes a
number of minor clarificatory amendments to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations. Part 2 of
the Amending Regulations came into force on 1 July 2015; Part 3 was originally due to come into
force on 11 January 2016 but, by virtue of S.I. 2015/2049, comes into force on 1 April 2016.

Subject to the exceptions in regulation 3, regulation 2 of this instrument revokes regulations
1(2)(b) and 2(2) and Part 3 of, and Schedules 4 to 13 to, the Amending Regulations and S.I.
2015/2049. The effect of these revocations is that the fixed fee schemes provided for by Part 3 of
the Amending Regulations will not come into force. Regulation 3 ensures that the minor
clarifications to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations in regulation 6 of the Amending
Regulations (amendments to the Criminal Remuneration Regulations) are not revoked.

Regulation 4 of, and Schedules 1 to 3 to, this instrument amend the existing fee schemes by
increasing the fees for advice, assistance and representation made available under sections 13, 15
and 16 of the Act.

The instrument does not apply to work done pursuant to a determination under section 13, 15 or
16 of the Act made before 1st April 2016.

A full impact assessment of the effect of the policy the implementation of which is revoked in part
by this instrument on the costs of the private, voluntary and public sectors was produced with the
Government’s response to the Transforming Legal Aid: Next Steps consultation, published on
27th February 2014, and is available at https://consult.justice.gov.uk/.

© Crown copyright 2016

Printed and published in the UK by The Stationery Office Limited under the authority and superintendence of Carol Tullo,
Controller of Her Majesty’s Stationery Office and Queen’s Printer of Acts of Parliament.

33



